

	TNH038-2015-Trees, Flowers & Shrubs		1	2	3	4	5
			Bissett Nursery Corp	The Garden Dept. Corp.	Bryan Wagoner Tree Farm, LLC	Barbato Nursery Corp	Landscaping by County Gardens, Inc.
							DBA County Gardens Nursery
			323 Long Island Ave	3672 Route 112	9948 Kerr Chapel Rd.,	1600 Railroad Ave	220 Old Country Rd.
			Hottsville, NY 11742	Coram, NY 11727	Gibsonville, NC 27249	Holbrook, NY 11741	Eastport, NY 11941
			631-289-3500 ext 118	631-736-3378 ext 11	336-585-0052	631-285-6767 ext 2	631-325-1522
			631-289-3521	631-736-6364	336-585-0039	631-285-6748	631-325-2723
			jennifer@bissettnursery.com	terri@gardendep.com	bryanstreefarm@aol.com	barbatolandscape@aol.com	info@countrygardensnursery.com

Item #	Section 1. Perennials		Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit
	Perennial Botanical Name	Perennial Common Name	Size				
1	Achillea	Yarrow	1gal	\$ 6.18	\$ 5.74	No Bid	\$ 10.00
2	Alchemilla	Lady's Mantle	1gal	\$ 6.18	\$ 5.64	No Bid	\$ 9.00
3	Anemone	Anemone	1gal	\$ 7.13	\$ 5.69	No Bid	\$ 10.00
4	Aquilegia	Columbine	3 quart	\$ 6.18	\$ 6.24	No Bid	1 gal \$9.00
5	Artemisia	Wormwood	1gal	\$ 6.18	\$ 5.90	No Bid	\$ 10.25
6	Astilbe	False Spirea	1.5gal	\$ 7.55	\$ 5.81	No Bid	1 gal \$10.25
7	Baptisia	False Indigo	1.5gal	\$ 6.48	\$ 5.81	No Bid	1 gal \$9.00
8	Buddleia	Butterfly Bush	3.8gal	\$ 24.74	\$ 14.75	No Bid	1 gal \$23.50
9	Coreopsis	Tickseed	1gal	\$ 6.18	\$ 5.40	No Bid	\$ 9.00
10	Crocosmia	Crocosmia	1.5gal	\$ 7.37	\$ 5.75	No Bid	1 gal \$10.25
11	Dicentra	Bleeding Heart	1.5gal	\$ 7.58	\$ 5.80	No Bid	1 gal \$10.75
12	Digitalis	Foxglove	1.5gal	\$ 6.65	\$ 5.90	No Bid	1 gal \$9.25
13	Echinacea	Conflower	1.5gal	\$ 7.13	\$ 5.40	No Bid	1 gal \$13.25
14	Hemerocallis	Daylily	1.5gal	\$ 7.37	\$ 5.24	No Bid	1 gal \$11.50
15	Hosta	Plantain Lily	1.5gal	\$ 7.13	\$ 5.24	No Bid	1 gal \$12.50
16	Iris	Iris	1.5gal	\$ 7.48	\$ 5.40	No Bid	1 gal \$12.00
17	Liatris	Gayfeather	1.5gal	\$ 6.48	\$ 5.70	No Bid	1 gal \$9.00
18	Ligularia	Ligularia	1.5gal	\$ 7.48	\$ 6.40	No Bid	1 gal \$10.75
19	Lilium	Lily	1.5gal	\$ 6.18	\$ 6.40	No Bid	1 gal 13.75
20	Liriope	Lily-turf	1gal	\$ 5.48	\$ 5.00	No Bid	\$ 8.00
21	Nepeta	Cat Mint	1gal	\$ 6.18	\$ 5.20	No Bid	\$ 9.50
22	Paeonia	Peony	2.3 gal	\$ 12.35	\$ 15.00	No Bid	2 gal \$18.50
23	Perovskia	Russian Sage	1.5gal	\$ 6.74	\$ 5.20	No Bid	1 gal \$9.50
24	Pulmonaria	Lungwort	1gal	\$ 7.84	\$ 5.20	No Bid	1 gal \$10.25
25	Salvia	Sage	1gal	\$ 6.18	\$ 5.20	No Bid	1 gal \$9.50
26	Sedum	Stonecrop	8"pan/1.5gal	\$ 7.37	\$ 5.20	No Bid	1 gal \$10.75
27	Stokesia	Stokes' Aster	1gal	\$ 6.18	\$ 5.60	No Bid	\$ 9.00
28	Lychnis	Maltese Cross	1 gal	\$ 6.18	\$ 6.00	No Bid	No Bid
29	Dianthus	Dianthus	1 gal	\$ 6.18	\$ 5.60	No Bid	\$ 8.50
30	Papaver	Poppy	1 gal	\$ 6.18	\$ 6.00	No Bid	\$ 8.50
31	Amsonia hubrichtii		Provide Qty. & Price	\$7.13-1gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 1 gal \$8.00
32	Carex	Ice Dance	Provide Qty. & Price	\$8.32-1 gal	No Bid	No Bid	1 gal \$11.75 1 gal \$6.50
33	Leucanthemum x superbum	Becky	Provide Qty. & Price	\$6.18-1 gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 1 gal \$6.25
34	Rudbeckia nitida	Autumn Sun	Provide Qty. & Price	\$6.18-1 gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 1 gal \$6.25
35	Stachys byzantina	Helene Von Stein	Provide Qty. & Price	\$7.13-1gal	No Bid	No Bid	1 gal \$10.00 1 gal \$6.25
Ornamental Grass							
36	Festuca	Fescue	1gal	\$ 6.42	\$ 6.00	No Bid	\$ 9.00
37	Hakonechola	Hakone Grass	3 quart	\$11.88 -1 gal	\$ 10.00	No Bid	1gal \$16.75
38	Miscanthus	Maiden Grass	1.5gal	\$ 8.44	\$ 6.00	No Bid	3 gal \$18.50
39	Panicum	Switch Grass	1.5gal	\$ 8.44	\$ 6.00	No Bid	1 gal \$12.00

TNH038-2015-Trees, Flowers & Shrubs			1	2	3	4	5
			Bissett Nursery Corp	The Garden Dept. Corp.	Bryan Wagoner Tree Farm, LLC	Barbato Nursery Corp	Landscaping by County Gardens, Inc.
			323 Long Island Ave Hottsville, NY 11742 631-289-3500 ext 118 631-289-3521 jennifer@bissettnursery.com	3672 Route 112 Coram, NY 11727 631-736-3378 ext 11 631-736-6364 terri@gardendep.com	9948 Kerr Chapel Rd., Gibsonville, NC 27249 336-585-0052 336-585-0039 bryanstreefarm@aol.com	1600 Railroad Ave Holbrook, NY 11741 631-285-6767 ext 2 631-285-6748 barbatolandscape@aol.com	DBA County Gardens Nursery 220 Old Country Rd. Eastport, NY 11941 631-325-1522 631-325-2723 info@countrygardensnursery.com
			Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit
40	Pennisetum	Fountain Grass	1.5 \$ 7.44	\$ 6.00	No Bid	1 gal \$13.00	\$ 7.50
41	Fern Botanical Name	Fern Common Name	Size	\$6.89-1 gal	No Bid	No Bid	2 gal \$9.
42	Adiantum	Maidenhair Fern	1gal \$ 6.89	\$ 5.90	No Bid	\$ 10.75	\$ 9.00
43	Athyrium	Lady Fern	1gal \$ 6.89	\$ 5.90	No Bid	\$ 9.50	\$ 7.50
44	Dryopteris	Wood Fern	1gal \$ 6.89	\$ 5.90	No Bid	\$ 10.25	\$ 7.50
45	Matteuccia	Ostrich Fern	1gal \$ 7.58	\$ 5.90	No Bid	\$ 9.25	\$ 8.50
46	Onoclea	Sensitive Fern	1gal \$ 6.89	\$ 5.90	No Bid	\$ 10.25	\$ 8.50
47	Osmunda	Flowering Fern	1gal \$ 7.58	\$ 5.90	No Bid	\$ 10.25	\$ 7.50
48	Polystichum	Holly Fern	1gal \$ 7.58	\$ 5.90	No Bid	\$ 9.50	\$ 7.50
49	Panicum virgatum	Heavy Metal	Provide Qty. & Price \$13.07-3gal	No Bid	No Bid		1 gal \$6.50
Section 2. Shrubs							
	Shrub Botanical Name	Common Name	Size	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit
50	Abelia	Glossy Abelia	3gal	\$ 14.94	\$ 15.00	No Bid	\$ 21.50 \$ 19.00
51	Aucuba japonica	Japanese Aucuba	3gal	\$ 19.58	\$ 18.00	No Bid	\$ 31.50 \$ 19.00
52	Azalea (Evergreen)	Evergreen Azalea	3gal	\$ 14.84	\$ 14.50	No Bid	\$ 21.50 \$ 16.00
53	Berberis thunbergii	Barberry	3gal	\$ 16.74	\$ 14.50	No Bid	\$ 25.75 No Bid
54	Buxus	Boxwood	3 gal & 5 gal	\$19.24/\$28.44	\$18.00/\$33.00	No Bid	\$25.50/\$38.50 \$22.00/\$38.00
55	Cedrus atlantica 'Glaucua'	Blue Atlas Cedar	7-8'	\$ 128.00	\$ 130.00	No Bid	\$ 190.00 \$ 165.00
56	Cercis canadensis	Redbud	15gal	\$ 84.45	\$ 90.00	No Bid	\$ 130.00 \$ 165.00
57	Cornus alba/sericea	Dogwood	3gal	\$ 12.94	\$ 15.00	No Bid	\$ 26.50 \$ 12.00
58	Cytisus (assorted colors)	Scotchbroom	2.5gal	\$ 17.44	\$ 16.00	No Bid	3 gal \$26.50 \$ 20.00
59	Daphne	Daphne	2gal	\$ 22.44	\$ 17.00	No Bid	No Bid \$ 24.00
60	Enkianthus	Enkianthus	3gal	\$ 24.84	\$ 19.00	No Bid	\$ 37.25 \$ 20.00
61	Euonymus japonica	Japanese Euonymus	3/5gal	\$ 28.88	\$17.00/\$31.00	No Bid	\$ 40.25 \$ 18.00
62	Euonymus fortunei	Euonymus	3gal	\$ 16.44	\$ 16.00	No Bid	\$ 22.15 No Bid
63	Forsythia intermedia	Forsythia	3gal	\$ 11.74	\$ 15.00	No Bid	\$ 17.75 \$ 16.00
64	Fothergilla	Fothergilla	3gal	\$ 19.94	\$ 16.00	No Bid	\$ 34.50 \$ 24.00
65	Hamamelis intermedia	Witchhazel	7gal	\$ 59.44	\$ 32.00	No Bid	3-4' \$56.00 \$ 36.00
66	Hydrangea species	Hydrangea	3/5gal	\$16.44/\$28.44	\$17.00/\$26.00	\$18.00-3gal	\$25.00/\$39.00 \$ 20.00
67	Ilex crenata (assorted varieties)	Japanese Holly	5gal	\$ 25.44	\$ 24.00	No Bid	\$ 41.50 \$ 34.00
68	Ilex meserveae (assorted varieties)	Meserveae Holly	5gal	\$ 29.74	\$ 30.00	No Bid	3 gal \$20.25 \$ 40.00
69	Juniperus chinensis (assorted varieties)	Juniper	3/5gal	\$13.74/\$23.44	\$14.00/\$26.00	No Bid	3 gal \$20.25 \$ 18.00
70	Juniperus horizontalis (assorted varieties)	Juniper	3gal	\$ 13.74	\$ 14.00	No Bid	\$ 20.25 \$ 18.00
71	Lagerstroemia (assorted colors)	Crape Myrtle	5gal	\$ 24.74	\$ 50.00	No Bid	\$ 33.50 \$ 36.00
72	Ligustrum	Privet	5gal	\$ 17.94	\$ 19.00	No Bid	\$ 25.00 \$ 24.00
73	Magnolia	Magnolia	7gal	\$ 64.44	\$ 50.00	No Bid	15 gal \$190.00 \$ 55.00
74	Myrica pensylvanica	Bayberry	3gal	\$ 15.24	\$ 17.00	No Bid	\$ 20.00 \$ 18.00
75	Nandina domestica	Heavenly Bamboo	3gal	\$ 18.44	\$ 16.00	No Bid	\$ 24.00 \$ 22.00
76	Picea glauca 'Conica'	Dwarf Alberta Spruce	3gal	\$ 25.18	\$ 21.00	No Bid	\$ 35.25 \$ 28.00
77	Picea pungens Glauca	Colorado Blue spruce	5-6'	\$ 79.44	\$ 75.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 118.00 \$ 95.00
78	Pieris japonica (assorted varieties)	Japanese Pieris	5gal	\$ 29.44	\$ 22.00	No Bid	\$ 48.00 \$ 40.00
79	Pinus mugo	Mugo Pine	3gal	\$ 18.74	\$ 15.00	No Bid	\$ 26.50 \$ 20.00

TNH038-2015-Trees, Flowers & Shrubs			1	2	3	4	5
			Bissett Nursery Corp	The Garden Dept. Corp.	Bryan Wagoner Tree Farm, LLC	Barbato Nursery Corp	Landscaping by County Gardens, Inc.
			323 Long Island Ave	3672 Route 112	9948 Kerr Chapel Rd.,	1600 Railroad Ave	DBA County Gardens Nursery
			Hottsville, NY 11742	Coram, NY 11727	Gibsonville, NC 27249	Holbrook, NY 11741	220 Old Country Rd.
			631-289-3500 ext 118	631-736-3378 ext 11	336-585-0052	631-285-6767 ext 2	Eastport, NY 11941
			631-289-3521	631-736-6364	336-585-0039	631-285-6748	631-325-1522
			jennifer@bissettnursery.com	terri@gardendep.com	bryanstreefarm@aol.com	barbatolandscape@aol.com	631-325-2723
			Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit
80	Prunus cistena	Purple leaf Sand Cherry	5gal \$ 23.24	\$ 19.00	No Bid	\$ 33.25	\$ 28.00
81	Prunus laurocerasus 'Otto Luyken'	Cherrylaurel	5gal \$ 29.44	\$ 26.00	No Bid	\$ 41.00	\$ 39.00
82	Prunus laurocerasus 'Schipkaensis'	Skip Laurel	5gal \$ 29.44	\$ 27.00	No Bid	\$ 41.00	\$ 39.00
83	Pyracantha	Firethorn	5gal \$ 31.94	\$ 25.00	No Bid	\$ 45.00	\$ 28.00
84	Rhamnus Fine Line	Buckthorn	3gal \$ 24.44	\$ 25.00	No Bid	\$ 19.50	No Bid
85	Rhododendron (various colors)	Rhododendron	3/5gal \$23.24/\$35.44	\$21.00/\$34.00	No Bid	\$34.00/\$61.00	\$ 28.00
86	Salix integra	Dappled Willow	3gal \$ 15.24	\$ 16.00	No Bid	\$ 19.00	\$ 16.00
87	Skimmia japonica	Japanese Skimmia	3gal \$ 25.94	\$ 19.00	No Bid	\$ 39.00	\$ 22.00
88	Spiraea (assorted varieties)	Spiraea	3gal \$ 12.33	\$ 15.00	No Bid	\$ 17.25	\$ 18.00
89	Syringa (assorted varieties)	Lilac	3/5gal \$21.44/\$24.44	\$15.00/\$22.00	\$25.00-3 gal	\$26.00/\$34.50	\$ 20.00
90	Taxus (assorted varieties)	Yews	24-30" \$ 29.44	\$ 27.00	No Bid	\$ 43.25	\$ 35.00
91	Viburnum (assorted varieties)	Viburnum	3/5gal \$16.74/\$23.34	\$15.00/\$22.00	\$18.00-3gal	\$26.00/\$34.50	\$ 18.00
92	Vitex	Chaste tree	3gal \$ 16.20	\$ 19.00	No Bid	\$ 22.50	\$ 24.00
93	Weigela	Weigela	3gal \$ 16.20	\$ 15.79	No Bid	\$ 25.25	\$ 18.00
94	Thuja occidentalis (assorted varieties)	American Arborvitae	4-5ft./5-6ft \$30.44/\$42.04	\$37.00/\$49.00	\$50.00/\$55.00	\$41.50/\$56.00	\$45.00/\$65.00
95	Thuja pilcata (assorted varieties)	Western Aborvitae	4-5ft/ 5-6ft \$42.44/\$58.04	\$59.00/\$75.00	\$60.00/\$70.00	5-6ft \$77.00	\$45.00/\$65.00
96	Rosa Sp.	Rose Species	3 gal \$15.74	\$ 15.00	No Bid	Rosa Rugosa \$16.00	\$ 20.00
97	Chamaecyparis Pisifera	Cypress	3 gal \$16.18	\$19.72	No Bid	\$ 24.00	\$ 20.00
98	Cupressocyparis leylandii	Leyland Cypress	4-5/5-6 \$44.44/\$65.04	\$65.00/\$90.00	\$ 50.00	5-6 \$104.00	\$45.00/\$65.00
99	Picea Abies	Norway Spruce	4-5/5-6 \$44.44/\$65.44	\$50.00/\$62.00	\$ 50.00	\$60.00/\$96.00	\$65.00/\$85.00
100	Juniperus Virginiana	Eastern Red Cedar	4-5/5-6 \$58.04/\$84.44	\$59.00/\$89.00	\$ 50.00	5-6 \$99.25	\$65.00/\$85.00
101	Amanagowa Cherry		25 gal \$ 129.44	\$ 145.00	No Bid	2 1/2 \$178.00	\$ 145.00
102	Cephalotaxus harringtonia	Duke Gardens'	Provide Qty. & Price \$ 22.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5 gal \$65.00
103	Clethra alnifolia	Compacta	Provide Qty. & Price \$ 17.04	No Bid	No Bid	#3 23.00	3 gal \$18.00
104	Daphne x transatlantica	Jim's Pride' (Daphne caucasica)	Provide Qty. & Price \$ 28.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
105	Hibiscus syriacus	Diana	Provide Qty. & Price \$ 21.24	No Bid	\$ 25.00	4-5' \$45.00	5 gal \$28.00
106	Hypericum frondosum	Sunburst	Provide Qty. & Price \$ 14.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3 gal \$20.00
107	Ilex crenata	Soft Touch'	Provide Qty. & Price \$ 14.44	No Bid	No Bid	#3 \$24.00	5 gal \$32.00
108	Stephanandra incisa	Crispa	Provide Qty. & Price \$ 14.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section 3. Vines and Groundcover							
Vines and Groundcovers							
109	Clematis	Clematis	3gal \$ 28.44	\$ 15.00	No Bid	\$ 30.50	\$ 28.00
110	Hydrangea petiolaris	Climbing Hydrangea	2gal \$ 26.74	\$ 15.00	No Bid	\$ 36.00	\$ 24.00
111	Ajuga (assorted varieties)	Bugleweed	Flat/24 \$ 19.44	\$ 20.00	No Bid	1 gal \$8.25	\$ 30.00
112	Hedera helix	English Ivy	Flat/24 \$ 19.44	\$ 19.00	No Bid	1 gal \$13.00	\$ 24.00
113	Pachysandra terminalis	Japanese spurge	Flat/24 \$ 18.44	\$ 18.50	No Bid	\$ 25.00	\$ 24.00
114	Vinca minor	Myrtle	Flat/24 \$ 19.44	\$ 18.50	No Bid	\$ 25.25	\$ 34.00
115	Asclepias tuberosa		Provide Qty. & Price \$ 6.54	NO Bid	No Bid	#1 \$12.00	1 gal \$8.50
116	Carex flaccosperma		Provide Qty. & Price \$ 7.44	NO Bid	No Bid	#1 \$12.00	2" plug \$1.50
117	Ceratostigma plumbaginoides		Provide Qty. & Price \$ 6.04	NO Bid	No Bid		1 gal \$10.00
118	Epimedium x perralchicum	Frohnleiten	Provide Qty. & Price \$ 6.94	NO Bid	No Bid	#1 \$12.00	1 gal \$9.00
119	Geranium x cantabrigiense	Biokovo	Provide Qty. & Price \$ 7.44	NO Bid	No Bid	#1 \$12.00	1 gal \$8.00

TNH038-2015-Trees, Flowers & Shrubs			1	2	3	4	5
			Bissett Nursery Corp	The Garden Dept. Corp.	Bryan Wagoner Tree Farm, LLC	Barbato Nursery Corp	Landscaping by County Gardens, Inc.
			323 Long Island Ave	3672 Route 112	9948 Kerr Chapel Rd.,	1600 Railroad Ave	DBA County Gardens Nursery
			Hottsville, NY 11742	Coram, NY 11727	Gibsonville, NC 27249	Holbrook, NY 11741	220 Old Country Rd.
			631-289-3500 ext 118	631-736-3378 ext 11	336-585-0052	631-285-6767 ext 2	Eastport, NY 11941
			631-289-3521	631-736-6364	336-585-0039	631-285-6748	631-325-1522
			jennifer@bissettnursery.com	terri@gardendep.com	bryanstreefarm@aol.com	barbatolandscape@aol.com	631-325-2723
			Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit
120	Heuchera Americana	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 8.44	NO Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1 gal \$8.00
121	Microbiota decussata	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 12.44	\$14.74-2 gal	No Bid	No Bid	3 gal \$22.00
122	Phlox subulata	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 6.44	\$5.99-1 gal	No Bid	#1 \$12.00	1 gal \$6.00
123	Phlox stolonifera	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 6.44	NO Bid	No Bid	#1 \$12.00	1 gal \$6.00
124	Sarcococca hookeriana var. humilis	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 9.74	\$9.00-1 gal	No Bid	#3 \$33.50	2 gal \$20.00
125	Schizachyrium scoparium	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 7.24	NO Bid	No Bid	#1 \$12.00	1 gal \$5.75
126	Waldsteinia ternata	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 9.24	NO Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1 gal \$9.50
Annuals		Size					
127	Assorted Annuals	Flats of 48	\$ 11.74	\$ 11.00	No Bid	\$ 18.95	No bid
128	Assorted Annuals	4 1/2 inch pot 15 per tray	\$ 28.44	\$ 2.50	No Bid	No Bid	No bid
129	Assorted Annuals	1 quart pot 8 per tray	\$ 31.44	NO Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No bid
130	Assorted Annuals	1 gallon annual (ex. Annual Hibiscus)	\$ 7.74	NO Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No bid
131	Assorted hanging baskets	10"	\$ 13.44	\$ 14.50	No Bid	\$ 21.95	No bid
Bulbs		Size					
132	Darwin Tulips	Price per 100	\$ 31.00	\$ 0.50	No Bid	\$ 50.00	\$ 100.00
133	Daffodils	Price per 100	\$ 31.00	\$ 0.50	No Bid	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.85
134	Hyacinth	Price per 100	\$ 45.00	\$ 0.50	No Bid	\$ 75.00	\$ 100.00
Section 4. Trees							
Common Name							
135	Maple	Red Sunset Maple	2" cal.	\$ 148.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 160.00
		Autumn Blaze Maple		\$ 148.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 160.00
		Brandywine Maple		\$ 148.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 160.00
		October Glory		\$ 148.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 160.00
		Pacific Sunset Maple		\$ 164.44	\$ 150.00	No Bid	\$ 160.00
		Red Sunset Maple		\$ 148.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 160.00
		Royal Red Norway Maple		\$ 154.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 160.00
		Somerset Red Maple		\$ 1,545.44	\$ 150.00	No Bid	\$ 160.00
		Sun Valley Red Maple		\$ 154.44	\$ 150.00	No Bid	\$ 195.00
136	Dogwood	White Flowering Dogwood	5-6'	\$ 67.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 125.00
137	Ginkgo		2" cal.	\$ 193.44	\$ 180.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 185.00
138	Cornus	Dogwood Cherry Brave	2" cal.	\$ 163.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 181.00
		Dogwood Cherry Princess		\$ 163.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 181.00
		Dogwood Stellar Pink		\$ 166.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 181.00
139	Crataegus	Winter King Hawthorn	2" cal.	\$ 155.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 183.00
140	Cupressocyparis	Leyland Cypress	5-6'	\$ 68.44	\$ 90.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 103.00
141	Euonymus	Burning Bush	2-3'	\$ 30.44	\$ 17.50	18-24'-\$25.00	2 gal \$22.25
142	Gleditsia	Skyline Honeylocust	2" cal.	\$ 149.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 162.00
143	Juniperus	Hollywood Juniper	5-6'	\$ 89.44	\$ 90.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 108.00
144		Red Cedar		\$ 86.44	\$ 89.00	5-6'-\$50.00	6-7' \$107.00
145	Pinus	White Pine		\$ 62.44	\$ 60.00	5-6' \$40.00/6-7'-\$55.00	6-7' \$119.00
146	Prunus(Cherry)	Canada Red Cherry	2" cal.	\$ 129.44	\$ 150.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 138.00

TNH038-2015-Trees, Flowers & Shrubs		1		2		3		4		5			
		Bissett Nursery Corp		The Garden Dept. Corp.		Bryan Wagoner Tree Farm, LLC		Barbato Nursery Corp		Landscaping by County Gardens, Inc.			
		323 Long Island Ave		3672 Route 112		9948 Kerr Chapel Rd.,		1600 Railroad Ave		220 Old Country Rd.			
		Hottsville, NY 11742		Coram, NY 11727		Gibsonville, NC 27249		Holbrook, NY 11741		Eastport, NY 11941			
		631-289-3500 ext 118		631-736-3378 ext 11		336-585-0052		631-285-6767 ext 2		631-325-1522			
		631-289-3521		631-736-6364		336-585-0039		631-285-6748		631-325-2723			
		jennifer@bissettnursery.com		terri@gardendep.com		bryanstreefarm@aol.com		barbatolandscape@aol.com		info@countrygardensnursery.com			
		Price/Unit		Price/Unit		Price/Unit		Price/Unit		Price/Unit			
		Yoshino Cherry	\$	119.44	\$	140.00	\$	75.00	\$	138.00	\$	165.00	
		Kwanzan	\$	119.44	\$	140.00	\$	85.00	\$	138.00	\$	165.00	
147	Prunus (Plums)	KV Purple Leaf Plum	2" cal.	\$	129.44	\$	140.00	\$	80.00	\$	138.00	\$	145.00
148	Quercus	Pin Oak	2" cal.	\$	152.44	\$	150.00	\$	85.00	\$	168.00	\$	175.00
		Red Oak		\$	162.44	\$	150.00	\$	95.00	\$	175.00	\$	175.00
		Scarlet Oak		\$	162.44	\$	150.00	\$	90.00	\$	175.00	\$	185.00
149	Thuja	Emerald Green	2" cal.	5-6' \$37.44		NO Bid		6-7' \$65.00		6-7' \$87.50	\$	55.00	
150	Ulmus	Prospector Elm	2" cal.	\$	162.44	\$	150.00	\$	85.00	\$	165.00	\$	165.00
151	Zelcova	Green Vase Zelcova	2" cal.	\$	158.44	\$	150.00	\$	110.00	\$	162.00	\$	165.00
		Musashino Zelcova		\$	175.44	\$	150.00		No Bid	\$	162.00	\$	165.00
		Village Green Zelcova		\$	162.44	\$	150.00	\$	110.00	\$	162.00	\$	165.00
152		Chantilear Pear	2" cal.	\$	116.44	\$	150.00		1 3/4' \$75.00	\$	137.00	\$	165.00
153	Acer ginnala	Amur Maple	2 1/2"	\$	192.44	\$	150.00		No Bid	\$	189.00	\$	195.00
154	Acer campestre	Hedge Maple	2 1/2"	\$	192.44	\$	165.00		No Bid	\$	189.00	\$	195.00
155	Acer buergeranum	Trident Maple	2 1/2"	\$	224.00	\$	164.00	\$	100.00	\$	190.00	\$	225.00
156	Acer tataricum	Tataricum Maple	2 1/2"	\$	224.00		NO Bid		No Bid	\$	190.00	\$	225.00
157	Amelanchier "Autum Sunset"	Serviceberry	2 1/2"	\$	213.74	\$	110.00	\$	105.00	\$	215.00	\$	225.00
158	"Cumulus", "Robin Hill Pink"			\$	213.74		NO Bid		No Bid	\$	215.00	\$	225.00
159	Carpinus caroliniana	American Hornbeam	2 1/2"	\$	208.74		NO Bid		2in 90-\$120.	\$	225.00	\$	245.00
160	Crataegus cruz-galli "Inermis"	Thornless Cockspur	2 1/2"	\$	184.44		NO Bid		No Bid	\$	214.00	\$	225.00
		Hawthorne					NO Bid		No Bid	\$	214.00	\$	225.00
161	Koelreuteria paniculata	Golden Raintree	2 1/2"	\$	224.00	\$	160.00		No Bid	\$	190.00	\$	225.00
162	Cornus kousa	Kousa Dogwood	2 1/2"	\$	197.44	\$	150.00		No Bid	\$	215.00	\$	225.00
163	Malus spp.	Crabapple species	2 1/2"	\$	169.44	\$	135.00		No Bid	\$	176.00	\$	185.00
		(disease resistant)							No Bid	\$	176.00		
164	Prunus spp. "Accolade"	Accolade Flowering Cherry	2 1/2"	\$	169.44		NO Bid		No Bid	\$	176.00	\$	195.00
		(disease resistant)							No Bid	\$	176.00		
165	Prunus virginiana "Canada Red"	Chokeberry	2 1/2"	\$	169.44	\$	165.00		2in \$75.00	\$	176.00	\$	195.00
166	Maackia amurensis	Amur maackia	2 1/2"	\$	264.44		NO Bid		No Bid	\$	190.00	\$	195.00
167	Pyrus calleryana "Chanticleer", "Aristocrat"	Callery Pear (not Bradford)	2 1/2"	\$	158.44	\$	125.00		No Bid	\$	165.00	\$	195.00
		"Capital", Whitehorse							No Bid				
168	Syringa reticulata	Japanese Tree Lilac	2 1/2"	\$	224.44	\$	160.00		No Bid	\$	175.00	\$	195.00
169	Princeton Elm		2" cal.	\$	208.44	\$	160.00	\$	90.00	\$	165.00	\$	165.00
170	Green Pillar Oak		2- 1/2" cal	\$	251.44		NO Bid	\$	70.00	\$	177.00	\$	225.00
171	Cher. Brave Dogwood		2" cal	\$	172.44		NO Bid	\$	85.00	\$	180.00	\$	165.00
172	Armstrong Maple		2" cal	\$	187.44		NO Bid	\$	90.00	\$	156.00	\$	165.00
173	Hornbeam-Franz Fonta		2" cal	\$	199.44		NO Bid	\$	100.00	\$	229.00	\$	195.00
174	Exclamation Sycamore		2" cal	\$	156.44		NO Bid	\$	90.00	\$	165.00	\$	165.00
175	Cleveland Select		2" cal	\$	123.44	\$	112.00		1 3/4 cal \$75.00	\$	137.00	\$	165.00
176	Sycamore		1-1/2" cal	\$	74.44		NO Bid		No Bid	\$	115.00	\$	125.00
177	Autumn Purple Ash		1 1/2" & 2" cal	\$	94.44		NO Bid		No Bid	\$	\$115.00/\$165.00	No bid	
178	Acer griseum	Provide Qty. & Price		\$	214.44		NO Bid		1 1/2' \$85.00-1 3/4-\$95.00- 2" \$110.00		2 1/2' \$250.00	2.5" \$295.00	

TNH038-2015-Trees, Flowers & Shrubs			1	2	3	4	5
			Bissett Nursery Corp	The Garden Dept. Corp.	Bryan Wagoner Tree Farm, LLC	Barbato Nursery Corp	Landscaping by County Gardens, Inc.
			323 Long Island Ave	3672 Route 112	9948 Kerr Chapel Rd.,	1600 Railroad Ave	DBA County Gardens Nursery
			Hottsville, NY 11742	Coram, NY 11727	Gibsonville, NC 27249	Holbrook, NY 11741	220 Old Country Rd.
			631-289-3500 ext 118	631-736-3378 ext 11	336-585-0052	631-285-6767 ext 2	Eastport, NY 11941
			631-289-3521	631-736-6364	336-585-0039	631-285-6748	631-325-1522
			jennifer@bissettnursery.com	terri@gardendep.com	bryanstreefarm@aol.com	barbatolandscape@aol.com	631-325-2723
			Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit	Price/Unit
179	Camellia japonica	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 52.44	NO Bid	6-7'\$125/ 7-8'\$150/ 8-9'\$175/ 9-10'\$200	No Bid	5 gal \$42.00
180	Carpinus betulus	Frans Fontaine Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 127.44	NO Bid	1 3/4" \$80.00/2" \$100.00	2" \$250.00	2.5" \$245.00
181	Cercis Canadensis	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 125.44	NO Bid	1 3/4' cal \$65.00	2 1/2 \$182.00	7 gal \$36.00
182	Chionanthus retusus	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 104.44	NO Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No bid
183	Cornus mas 'Golden Glory'	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 129.44	NO Bid	No Bid	Golden Shadows 10 gal \$75.00	6-8' \$150.00
184	Corylopsis pauciflora	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 28.44	NO Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No bid
185	Parrotia persica	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 184.44	NO Bid	25gal \$85.00	2 1/2 \$190.00	2" \$195.00
186	Picea orientalis	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 178.44	NO Bid	No Bid	5-6' \$250.00	No bid
187	Sciadopitys verticillata	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 324.44	NO Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5-6' \$500.
188	Sorbus alnifolia	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 225.44	NO Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No bid
189	Stewartia pseudocamellia	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 265.44	NO Bid	25 gal \$110.00	2 1/2 \$255.00	6-7' \$350.
190	Styrax japonicus	Emerald Pagoda Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 235.44	NO Bid	No Bid	2 1/2 \$185.00	8-10' \$195.00
191	Thujaopsis dolabrata	Nana Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 32.44	NO Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No bid
192	Acer griseum	Provide Qty. & Price	\$ 214.44	NO Bid	1 1/2" \$85.00/ 1 3/4" \$95.00/ 2" \$110.00	2 1/2 \$250.00	3" \$275.00
193	Camellia japonica	Provide Qty. & Price	2-3' \$52.44	NO Bid	6-7' \$125/7-8'\$150/8-9'\$175/9-10'\$200		5 gal \$42.00
Section 5 Misc:							
194	Cedar tree stakes	5/6'	\$ 3.74	\$ 3.60	No Bid	6/8' \$5.50/\$6.75	\$ 5.50
195	Planters	"Fiber glass"	18" dia./20"	\$ 94.44	NO Bid	No Bid	No bid
			dia./22"	\$ 104.44	NO Bid	No Bid	No bid
			dia./24"	\$ 124.44	NO Bid	No Bid	No bid
			dia		NO Bid	No Bid	Minimum order for delivery is \$1,000
			Min order \$250.00 for delivery		Freight estimate is \$2,200 per truck load.	Otherwise \$250.00 delivery charge additional	

Subject to change due to unstable fuel costs.
Prices quoted for trees only
Freight for the first year is \$2,200
We will inform the Town at the beginning of the 2nd year if we can continue at that rate or if fuel costs deem a change